From: Bowman, Randal

To: Eisher, George

Subject: Re: end of contract with DiscoverText
Date: Tuesday, November 07, 2017 8:40:12 AM

It should comein today. | just talked with Marcia and she had been tied up on other things, but
but is finished with those and will focus on the contract.

On Tue, Nov 7, 2017 at 9:38 AM, Fisher, George <geoarge_fisher@ibc.doi.gov> wrote:
Any word on if there are any outstanding invoices?

George Fisher
Contract Specialist

o Telework every Friday

Acquisition Services Directorate
Interior Business Center

(703) 964-4815 (Office) Herndon
(571) 328-9671 (Cellphone)
(703) 964-8490 (FAX)

George Fisher@ibc.doi.gov
US Department of the Interior

Office of the Secretary
doi.gov/ibc

Your Focus: Your Mission
Our Focus: You

On Wed, Nov 1, 2017 at 3:37 PM, Fisher, George <george_fisher@ibc.doi.gov> wrote:
That's what | was thinking too.

George Fisher
Contract Specialist

o Telework every Friday

Acquisition Services Directorate
Interior Business Center

(703) 964-4815 (Office) Herndon
(571) 328-9671 (Cellphone)
(703) 964-8490 (FAX)

George Fisher@ibc.doi.gov

US Department of the Interior

Office of the Secretary
doi.gov/ibc

Your Focus; Your Mission
Our Focus: You
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On Wed, Nov 1, 2017 at 3:34 PM, Bowman, Randal <randal_bowman@ios.doi.gov>
wrote:

The amount spent seems too low. In thinking back, | got the second approval for an
increase because we were advised we had nearly used all of the available funds, so | will
ask Marshato check with the company to ensure they have no more invoices pending
and have been paid on all submitted.

On Wed, Nov 1, 2017 at 3:21 PM, Bowman, Randal <randal_bowman@ios.doi.gov>
wrote:

Thanks. | forwarded your question to her already.

On Wed, Nov 1, 2017 at 3:20 PM, Fisher, George <george fisher@ibc.doi.gov>
wrote:
Thetotal value with al the extras labor, licenses, and storage was $27,906.71. Of
that we spent $23,386.71. There is $4,520.00 still left on the task order; $1,588.75
in grad labor and $2,931.25 in project manager labor. That's quite an amount to de-
obligate. Let's check with Marsha and make sure there are no outstanding invoices
before | send it to closeout and they remove all remaining funds.

Thanks,

George Fisher
Contract Specialist

o Telework every Friday

Acquisition Services Directorate
Interior Business Center

(703) 964-4815 (Office) Herndon
(571) 328-9671 (Cellphone)
(703) 964-8490 (FAX)

George Fisher@ibc.doi.gov

US Department of the Interior

Office of the Secretary
doi.gov/ibc

Your Focus; Your Mission

Our Focus: You

On Wed, Nov 1, 2017 at 3:00 PM, Bowman, Randal
<randal_bowman@ios.doi.gov> wrote:

L et me check with Marsha, but | believe the contract is finished and all bills
received. Sheisontravel and | won't get an answer until tomorrow.

| actually was about to send you a question on this - presuming no more expenses,
how much did we spend on this contract? | believeit is about $30,000 or $35,000,
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but can't recall which.

On Wed, Nov 1, 2017 at 2:51 PM, Fisher, George <george_fisher@ibc.doi.gov>
wrote:
Quick question. There are funds left on lineitem 60, 90, and 100. Can | assume
there will be no invoice for the remaining amounts and we can de-obligate these
funds?

George Fisher
Contract Specialist

o Telework every Friday

Acquisition Services Directorate
Interior Business Center

(703) 964-4815 (Office) Herndon
(571) 328-9671 (Cellphone)
(703) 964-8490 (FAX)

George Fisher@ibc.doi.gov

US Department of the Interior

Office of the Secretary
dai.gov/ibc

Your Focus; Your Mission
Our Focus: You

On Mon, Oct 16, 2017 at 9:02 AM, Fisher, George
<george_fisher@ibc.doi.gov> wrote:

Thank you, | will put your email in their file.

George Fisher
Contract Specialist

o Telework every Friday

Acquisition Services Directorate
Interior Business Center

(703) 964-4815 (Office) Herndon
(571) 328-9671 (Cellphone)
(703) 964-8490 (FAX)

George Fisher@ibc.doi.gov
US Department of the Interior

Office of the Secretary
doi.gov/ibc

Your Focus: Your Mission
Our Focus: You

On Tue, Oct 10, 2017 at 11:17 AM, Bowman, Randal
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<randal_bowman(@ios.doi.gov> wrote:

I don't know if thisisusual, but wanted you to know that we encountered a
number of unexpected and as | was advised, novel, issuesin the course of
reviewing the 2.8 million public comments under this contract. We ended up
using approaches and methods the contract system was not designed for.
The company bent over backwards to address our needs and timelines, and
resolved problems usually overnight. | would strongly recommend them.
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