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To: Johnson, Amber[a2johnson@blm.gov]
From: Ashcroft, Tyler
Sent: 2017-06-12T18:55:19-04:00

Importance: Normal
Subject: Re: L1711 - Extra Funds?
Received: 2017-06-12T18:55:26-04:00

Thanks for the information. I have not heard back from Keith or Casey. I will send an email right
now.
Talk to you tomorrow.

On Mon, Jun 12, 2017 at 4:49 PM, Johnson, Amber <a2johnson@blm.gov> wrote:

I'm happy to pass on the 1711 funds, and I would like some additional one-time
funds. Patrick is officially acting as it is his month, but we met with Don this
morning and he said that if it is recreation related I could act and if Patrick was out,
I was acting for the office in general. I thought we could talk about it tomorrow
after we discuss the status of the on-going projects with Casey and Kieth. Did you
hear back from Kieth? Is he on board for tomorrow?

I'll let Allison know that we will not compete this year and will let the other units work
it out.

Amber

Amber Denton Johnson

Supervisory Outdoor Recreation Planner
BLM, Monticello Field Office
435-587-1505

On Mon, Jun 12, 2017 at 3:12 PM, Ashcroft, Tyler <tashcrof(@blm.gov> wrote:

Amber,

Just wanted you to be aware of this since Don is out of the office. I am assuming you are his
acting? We still have a lot of one-time funds to spend. Not sure that we need the 1711
money unless you have a specific project in mind. Let me know your thoughts.

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: Ginn, Allison <aginn@blm.gov>

Date: Mon, Jun 12,2017 at 12:55 PM

Subject: Fwd: L1711 - Extra Funds?

To: "Staszak, Cynthia" <cstaszak@blm.gov>, Dawna Ferris <d8ferris@blm.gov>, Donald
Hoftheins <dhoffhei@blm.gov>, "Ashcroft, Tyler" <tashcrof(@blm.gov>

Cc: Aaron Curtis <acurtis@blm.gov>
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| would like to have a quick call this week to discuss unfunded needs for L1711 that could be spent in FY17. |
am suggesting Thursday at 11 am. We have $48K to spread. The money must be able to be obligated this
fiscal year.

If you would like to compete for funding, please "reply all" with your top 1-2 projects (up to $48K) and include
a brief description of the project and the amount of funding requested. If you do not have any additional
shovel-ready projects that can be obligated this FY, please let us know and you do not need to participate
in the conference call.

We will hold a brief call to determine funding priorities. If we can come to consensus, I'll have Tiffany obligate
the money immediately.

Thanks!
Regards,

Allison Ginn

National Conservation Lands Program Lead
BLM Utah State Office

801-539-4053

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Martinez, Tiffany <tmartine@blm.gov>
Date: Mon, Jun 12,2017 at 12:28 PM

Subject: Re: L1711 - Extra Funds?

To: "Ginn, Allison" <aginn@blm.gov>

Hi Allison,

WO provided an additional $ 48,000 in L1711 at AWP. This funding was not attached
to a specific project/earmark. It would be great if you can hold a call and provide us
with a recommendation on where the funding should be allocated.

FYI... GSENM did submit a unfunded request of $ 50,000 for Law Enforcement costs.

Please call with questions. Have a good day!

Tiffany Martinez

Budget Analyst Bureau of Land Management
Utah State Office Division of Support Services
440 West 200 South, Suite 500, SLC, UT 84101
Phone: (801) 539 4166 Fax: (801) 539 4222
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On Mon, Jun 12,2017 at 11:01 AM, Ginn, Allison <aginn@blm.gov> wrote:

Tiffany-

Aaron mentioned that we might have some additional L1711 funds this year. If so, | will hold a call with Bears
Ears, GSENM and the SGFO NCAs to determine how best to put them to use.

Do you have a ballpark figure of the unallocated funds? No hurry. Thanks!

Regards,

Allison Ginn

National Conservation Lands Program Lead
BLM Utah State Office

801-539-4053

Tyler Ashcroft

Project Manager

Bureau of Land Management
(801)-539-4068

Tyler Ashcroft

Project Manager

Bureau of Land Management
(801)-539-4068
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