Bureau of Land Management
Southern Nevada Public Land Management Act
Summer 2019 Lands Sale

August 29, 2019

WINNING BID REPORT

BLM Serial Gross Fair Market Winning Bid Winning Bidder
Number Acres Value Amount

N-96215 5.00 $620,000 $1,230,000 AALG, LLC

N-96216 5.00 $295,000 $345,000 Phil Davis

N-80697 10.00 $1,700,000 NO BID

N-96217 10.00 $3,500,000 $3,500,000 Ken Templeton Realty & Investments

N-96218 1.87 $776,000 NO BID

N-96219 5.00 $2,075,000 $2,400,000 KB Home Las Vegas, Inc.

N-96220 20.00 $1,175,000 $4,200,000 | Las Vegas Paving Corp.

N-92830 2.50 $350,000 NO BID

N-92832 2.50 $350,000 NO BID

N-96221 5.00 $1,440,000 NO BID

N-96222 8.75 $1,710,000 NO BID

N-96223 7.50 $1,460,000 NO BID

N-96224 15.00 $4,800,000 $8,000,000 D. R. Horton, Inc.

N-96225 2.50 $380,000 $460,000 Peter J. and Angela A. Becker

N-96226 2.50 $670,000 NO BID

N-96227 7.50 $1,890,000 $1,890,000 Las Vegas Paving Corp.

N-96228 5.00 $970,000 $970,000 Khusrow Roohani

N-96229 2.50 $900,000 NO BID

N-96230 WITHDRAWN

N-92847 12.50 $5,640,000 $5,640,000 American West Development, Inc.

N-79928 2.50 $850,000 NO BID

N-96231 15.00 $3,300,000 NO BID

N-96232 7.50 $3,150,000 $3,500,000 Allen Benyamin & Bob Kashani

N-96233 10.00 $2,390,000 NO BID

N-96234 10.00 $2,000,000 NO BID




N-96816 5.00 $250,000 $250,000 Omni Family LP

N-96818 5.00 $250,000 $250,000 Omni Family LP

N-96820 20.625 $720,000 $1,150,000 Real Capital Corporation
N-84198 5.00 $238,000 $320,000 Omni Family LP

N-84181 21.875 $710,000 $1,440,000 Real Capital Corporation
N-96821 20.00 $1,600,000 NO BID

N-96822 30.00 $9,600,000 $11,400,000 Harmony Homes Nevada, LLC
N-96823 25.00 $6,750,000 NO BID

N-96824 270.00 $43,200,000 $43,200,000 190 Octane FT Partners, L.L.C
N-96825 10.00 $4,000,000 $4,000,000 D. R. Horton, Inc.

N-96827 10.00 $4,000,000 $4,760,000 KB Home Las Vegas, Inc.
N-96828 5.00 $850,000 NO BID

N-96829 5.00 $850,000 NO BID

N-80700 10.00 $1,700,000 NO BID

N-96830 10.00 $1,700,000 NO BID

N-96846 5.39 $700,000 NO BID

N-94552 5.43 $2,932,000 $2,932,000 AMH Development

N-96831 10.00 $3,900,000 $6,050,000 KB Home Las Vegas, Inc.
N-96832 5.00 $1,900,000 $2,620,000 American Nevada Fort Apache, LLC
N-80719 5.00 $1,600,000 NO BID

N-96833 2.50 $348,000 $348,000 Christina Turney

N-96834 25.00 $8,125,000 $14,300,000 KB Home Las Vegas, Inc.
N-96835 5.00 $970,000 $970,000 Khusrow Roohani

N-96836 12.50 $2,560,000 $2,560,000 D. R. Horton, Inc.

N-96837 20.00 $4,280,000 NO BID

N-96838 10.00 $3,200,000 $5,450,000 KB Home Las Vegas, Inc.
N-79558 5.00 $350,000 $380,000 Khusrow Roohani

N-96839 2.50 $350,000 $350,000 Jennifer Basilio

N-94543 15.00 $6,600,000 NO BID

N-96840 20.00 $6,400,000 $10,600,000 American West Development, Inc.
N-91539 22.50 $3,600,000 NO BID




N-96841 15.00 $3,600,000 $4,700,000 AMH Development
N-96842 20.00 $5,400,000 $7,700,000 AMH Development
N-96843 10.00 $4,200,000 $5,560,000 KB Home Las Vegas, Inc.
N-96845 5.00 $1,745,000 $2,130,000 Gurdev Kular
N-96844 39.41 $4,010,000 $5,650,000 AALG, LLC
[ —
TOTAL 888.35 | $185,579,000.00 | $171,205,000.00




