
 SOLICITATION/CONTRACT/ORDER FOR COMMERCIAL ITEMS 1. REQUISITION NUMBER PAGE 1 OF 46 

Offeror to complete blocks 12, 17, 23, 24, & 30 
2. CONTRACT NO. 3. AWARD/EFFECTIVE DATE 4. ORDER NUMBER 5. SOLICITATION NUMBER 6. SOLICITATION ISSUE DATE 

NBC030010 

7. ION 
A. NAME B. TELEPHONE (No Collect Calls) 8. OFFER DUE DATE/ 

LOCAL TIME 

INFORMATION CALL ➨ 
9. ISSUED BY CODE BC662 10. THIS ACQUISITION IS 11. DELIVERY B 

DESTINATION UNLESS 
12. DISCOUNT TERMS 

?UNRESTRICTED BLOCK IS MARKED 
⌧SEE SCHEDULE 

BLM NATIONAL BUSINESS CENTER �  SET-ASIDE: % FOR � 13a. THIS CONTRACT IS A RATED ORDER 
BC 662 BLDG. 50, DFC, PO BOX 25047 � SMALL BUSINESS UNDER DPAS (15 CFR 700) 

DENVER, CO 80225-0047 � SMALL DISADV. BUS. 13b. RATING 

� 8(A) 
SIC:  3663 14. METHOD OF SOLICITATION 

SIZE STANDARD:  750  RFQ IFB RFP 
15. DELIVER TO: CODE 16. ADMINISTERED BY CODE 

SEE SF1449 CONTINUATION SAME AS BLOCK 9 

17a. CONTRACTOR/OFFEROR CODE FACILITY 18a. PAYMENT WILL BE MADE BY CODE 

King Communications USA, Inc. 
1583 East Silver Star Road, Suite 329 SEE SF1449 CONTINUATION 
Ocoee, FL 34761 

18b. T INVOICES TO ADDRESS SHOWN IN BLOCK 18a UNLESS BLOCK BELOW IS CHECKED: 

17b.  IF REMITTANCE IS DIFFERENT AND PUT SUCH ADDRESS IN OFFER ? SEE ADDENDUM 

19. 
ITEM NO, 

20. 
SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES 

21. 
QUANTITY 

22. 
UNIT 

23. 
UNIT PRICE 

24. 
AMOUNT 

*** See SF1449 CONTINUATION*** 

25. ACCOUNTING AND APPROPRIATION DATA 26. TOTAL AWARD AMOUNT (For Govt.Use Only) 

Funds will be cited on each delivery order 
27a. SOLICITATIONS INCORPORATE BY REFERENCE  FAR 52.212-1, 52.212-4.  FAR 52.212-3 AND 52.212-5 ARE ATTACHED. DDENDA ARE ARE NOT ATTACHED. 

⌧27b. CONTRACTS/PURCHASE ORDERS INCORPORATE BY REFERENCE FAR 52.212-4.  FAR 52.212-5 IS ATTACHED. ADDENDA ⌧ ARE ARE NOT ATTACHED. 
28. 
⌧ 

CONTRACTOR IS REQUIRED TO SIGN THIS DOCUMENT AND RETURN __2_____ COPIES TO ISSUING 
OFFICE. ONTRACTOR AGREES TO FURNISH AND DELIVER ALL ITEMS SET FORTH OR OTHERWISE 
IDENTIFIED ABOVE AND ON ANY ADDITIONAL SHEETS SUBJECT TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
SPECIFIED HEREIN. 

29. 
⌧ 

AWARD OF CONTRACT: OFFER DATED . YOUR 
OFFER ON SOLICITATION (BLOCK 5), INCLUDING ANY ADDITIONS OR CHANGES 
WHICH ARE SET FORTH HEREIN, IS ACCEPTED AS TO  ITEMS: (see CLINs) 

30a. SIGNATURE OF OFFEROR/CONTRACTOR 31a. UNITED STATES OF AMERICA (SIGNATURE OF CONTRACTING OFFICER) 

30b. NAME AND TITLE OF SIGNER (TYPE OR PRINT) 30c. DATE SIGNED 31b. NAME OF CONTRACTING OFFICER 31c. DATE SIGNED 

32a. QUANTITY IN COLUMN 20 HAS BEEN 33. SHIP NUMBER 34. DO VOUCHER NUMBER 35. AMOUNT VERIFIED 
CORRECT FOR 

�  RECEIVED �  INSPECTED � ACCEPTED, AND CONFORMS TO THE PARTIAL FINAL 

CONTRACT, EXCEPT AS NOTED 36, PAYMENT 37. CHECK NUMBER 

32b. GNATURE OF AUTHORIZED GOVT. REPRESENTATIVE 32c. DATE �  COMPLETE �  PARTIAL �  FINAL 
38. S/R ACCOUNT NUMBER 39. R VOUCHER NUMBER 40. PAID BY 

42a. RECEIVED BY (Print) 
41a. I CERTIFY THIS ACCOUNT IS CORRECT AND PROPER FOR PAYMENT 

41b. SIGNATURE AND TITLE OF CERTIFYING OFFICER 41c. TE 42b. VED AT (Location) 

42c. DATE REC’D (YY/MM/DD) 42d. TOTAL CONTAINERS 

STANDARD FORM 1449  (10-95) 

FOR SOLICITAT

FOFOR 

SUBMI

CHECK

A

C
REFERENCE 

SI

S/

DA RECEI
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SF 1449 CONTINUATION 

BLOCK 15 – Delivery to: 

Delivery shall be f.o.b. destination to any location within the continental United States (conus). Delivery to other 
locations may be negotiated for individual orders. Such delivery conditions will be included on the delivery orders. 

Delivery of the scheduled supplies/services shall be made within 90 days after order issue date unless otherwise 
specified in the deliver orders. Shorter or longer delivery schedules may be negotiated for individual orders. Partial 
shipments will be accepted unless otherwise stated in the delivery order. 

BLOCK 18b – Payment will be made by: 

This contract is open to all federal agencies for ordering purposes. The ordering activities will identify the payment 
office and the address for submission of invoices on the individual delivery orders. 

BLOCKS 19 to 24 – Item No., Schedule of Supplies/Services, Quantity, Unit, Unit Prices, 
Amount 

Item Description – General 

This contract provides for Project 25 compliant radio communication and control equipment, test equipment, and 
miscellaneous services. The contract is a firm fixed priced multiple award Indefinite Quantity Indefinite Delivery 
contract, open to all federal agencies, with a base contract year and four option years. 

Quantity Discounts 

The contractor may offer quantity discounts to the scheduled prices for large orders. Ordering activities are 
encouraged to solicit discounts for large orders. 

Minimum/Maximum Quantities 

The minimum quantity guaranteed, in accordance with FAR 16.504, is $25,000 for each contract and $2,500,000 for 
all contracts awarded under Solicitation Number NAR010099, for the life of the contract(s), including options. The 
maximum quantity applies to all contracts in total and is established at $1,000,000,000, of which $500,000,000 is 
reserved for the Department of Interior, for the life of the contracts, including options. 

In order to monitor contract usage and ensure the maximum limitations are not exceeded, the contractor shall submit 
semi-annual reports to the Contracting Officer within 30 days after periods ending March 31 and September 30. The 
report shall identify the number of major equipment items (excludes accessories, manuals, etc.) and total sales value 
(including accessories, manuals, etc.) for each major equipment category (i.e. X01, X02, etc.), as well as cumulative 
contract-to-date amounts, broken out by DOI and non-DOI orders. As contract usage nears the maximum amounts, 
the Contractor shall provide more frequent reports as determined necessary by the Contracting Officer.  Reports 
shall be provided in Excel or Lotus spreadsheet format and submitted in electronic form on 3.5 inch floppy disks, 
CD-ROMs, or emailed electronic copies. 

Unit of Measure 

Block 22 is not printed on the following schedules, but the unit of measure is “each” for all equipment items, service 
manuals, installation/removal services, and maintenance service. For training classes and any other services, the 
description shall indicate the unit of measure. 



Page 3 of 46 

ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

X01 VHF BASE STATIONS WITH CONTROL 
OPTIONS 

001A 100 Watts VHF 

001B 2-Radio Version 

001C 50 Watts VHF 

001D 2-Radio Version 

DMR-AAB4X1-
VH-XX-XXXX $14,108.80 $14,249.89 $14,390.98 $14,532.06 $14,673.15 
DMR-AXB4X1-
VH-VH-XXXX $20,367.95 $20,571.63 $20,775.31 $20,978.99 $21,182.67 
DMR-AAB4X1-
VL-XX-XXXX $12,979.90 $13,109.70 $13,239.50 $13,369.30 $13,499.10 
DMR-AXB4X1-
VH-VH-XXXX $19,438.74 $19,633.13 $19,827.51 $20,021.90 $20,216.29 

OPTIONS/UPGRADES/ACCESSORIES 
001A01 19" Rack Mounting KDFRMT $109.00 $110.09 $111.18 $112.27 $113.36 
001A02 Desk Mic KDMIC $108.00 $109.08 $110.16 $111.24 $112.32 
001A03 Palm DTMF Mic - Standard KDTMFMICS $145.00 $146.45 $147.90 $149.35 $150.80 
001A04 Palm DTMF Mic - Ruggedized KDTMFMICR $165.00 $166.65 $168.30 $169.95 $171.60 

Floor Mount Housing (60h x 25w x 26d) 2 door 
001A05 indoor locking cabinet) KDCAB60 $1,682.00 $1,698.82 $1,715.64 $1,732.46 $1,749.28 
001A06 Coaxial Relay and cables KDRELAY $545.00 $550.45 $555.90 $561.35 $566.80 
001A07 50 Watt PA Module KDPA50V $991.53 $1,001.45 $1,011.36 $1,021.28 $1,031.19 
001A08 100 Watt PA Module KDPA100V $1,491.67 $1,506.59 $1,521.50 $1,536.42 $1,551.34 
001A09 Interface Module (4 wire) KD4WIRE $560.70 $566.31 $571.91 $577.52 $583.13 
001A10 Interface Module (2/4 wire) KD24WIRE $2,500.00 $2,525.00 $2,550.00 $2,575.00 $2,600.00 
001A11 Base Controller Module KDCONTB $2,875.28 $2,904.03 $2,932.79 $2,961.54 $2,990.29 
001A12 Speaker Panel Assembly KDSPKR $183.33 $185.16 $187.00 $188.83 $190.66 
001A13 VHF Tranceiver module KDTCVR $4,943.88 $4,993.32 $5,042.76 $5,092.20 $5,141.64 
001A14 AC Power Supply (for 50 Watt PA) KDPS50V $1,402.50 $1,416.53 $1,430.55 $1,444.58 $1,458.60 
001A15 AC Power Supply (for 100 Watt PA) KDPS100V $1,700.00 $1,717.00 $1,734.00 $1,751.00 $1,768.00 
001A16 Dual station AC w/DC revert Case (w/backplane) KDBCKPLN $2,916.67 $2,945.84 $2,975.00 $3,004.17 $3,033.34 

50 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver, 
001A17 Power Supply, 50W PA) KDTCVRPS50V $7,337.91 $7,411.29 $7,484.67 $7,558.05 $7,631.43 

100 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver, 
001A18 Power Supply, 100W PA) KDTCVRPS100V $8,155.55 $8,237.11 $8,318.66 $8,400.22 $8,481.77 
001A19 Transceiver Programming Software and Hardware KDPROG $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
001A20 P25 DES Encryption - Licensed software KDDES $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
001A21 P25 Trunking - Licensed software KDTRK $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

001A22 Diagnostic Monitoring - Licensed software KDZDM $208.33 $210.41 $212.50 $214.58 $216.66 
001A23 OTAR - Licensed software KDOTAR $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
001A24 Link Radio (per radio) - Licensed software KDLINK $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
001A25 Data/IP interface software - Licensed software KDDATA $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 

TRAINING 

001AA01

Training (per course), User Training, 2 Day, 20 
students maximum + travel & per diem charge. KDTRAIN $2,000.00 $2,020.00 $2,040.00 $2,060.00 $2,080.00 

TECHNICAL SERVICE MANUALS 
001AB01 Owners/Installation Manual KDMANUAL $50.00 $50.50 $51.00 $51.50 $52.00 

SERVICES 
Consultation Service for base station or repeater 
installation (2 days): plus travel & per diem charges KDSITE $500.00 $505.00 $510.00 $515.00 $520.00001AC01


X02 UHF BASE STATIONS WITH CONTROL 
OPTIONS 

DMR-AAB4X2-

UH-XX-XXXX $14,408.80 $14,552.89 $14,696.98 $14,841.06 $14,985.15
002A 100 Watts UHF 
DMR-AXB4X2-

UH-UH-XXXX $21,685.70 $21,902.56 $22,119.41 $22,336.27 $22,553.13
002B 2-Radio Version 
DMR-AAB4X2-

UH-XX-XXXX $13,279.90 $13,412.70 $13,545.50 $13,678.30 $13,811.10
002C 50 Watts UHF 
DMR-AXB4X2-

UH-UH-XXXX $20,079.41 $20,280.20 $20,481.00 $20,681.79 $20,882.59
002D 2-Radio Version 

OPTIONS/UPGRADES/ACCESSORIES 
002A01 19" Rack Mounting KDFRMT $109.00 $110.09 $111.18 $112.27 $113.36 
002A02 Desk Mic KDMIC $108.00 $109.08 $110.16 $111.24 $112.32 
002A03 Palm DTMF Mic - Standard KDTMFMICS $145.00 $146.45 $147.90 $149.35 $150.80 
002A04 Palm DTMF Mic - Ruggedized KDTMFMICR $165.00 $166.65 $168.30 $169.95 $171.60 

002A05

Floor Mount Housing (60h x 25w x 26d) 2 door 
indoor locking cabinet) KDCAB60 $1,682.00 $1,698.82 $1,715.64 $1,732.46 $1,749.28 

002A06 Coaxial Relay and cables KDRELAY $545.00 $550.45 $555.90 $561.35 $566.80 
002A07 50 Watt PA Module KDPA50U $1,246.67 $1,259.14 $1,271.60 $1,284.07 $1,296.54 
002A08 100 Watt PA Module KDPA100U $1,716.67 $1,733.84 $1,751.00 $1,768.17 $1,785.34 
002A09 Interface Module (4 wire) KD4WIRE $560.70 $566.31 $571.91 $577.52 $583.13 
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

002A10 Interface Module (2/4 wire) KD24WIRE $2,500.00 $2,525.00 $2,550.00 $2,575.00 $2,600.00 
002A11 Base Controller Module KDCONTB $2,875.28 $2,904.03 $2,932.79 $2,961.54 $2,990.29 
002A12 Speaker Panel Assembly KDSPKR $183.33 $185.16 $187.00 $188.83 $190.66 
002A13 UHF Tranceiver module KDTCUR $5,218.88 $5,271.07 $5,323.26 $5,375.45 $5,427.64 
002A14 AC Power Supply (for 50 Watt PA) KDPS50U $1,402.50 $1,416.53 $1,430.55 $1,444.58 $1,458.60 
002A15 AC Power Supply (for 100 Watt PA) KDPS100U $1,700.00 $1,717.00 $1,734.00 $1,751.00 $1,768.00 
002A16 Dual station Case Assembly (with backplane) KDBCKPLN $2,916.67 $2,945.84 $2,975.00 $3,004.17 $3,033.34 

50 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver, 
Power Supply, 50W PA) KDTCVRPS50U $7,868.05 $7,946.73 $8,025.41 $8,104.09 $8,182.77002A17

100 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver,

Power Supply, 100W PA) KDTCVRPS100U $8,635.55 $8,721.91 $8,808.26 $8,894.62 $8,980.97
002A18


002A19 Transceiver Programming Software and Hardware KDPROG $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
002A20 P25 DES Encryption - Licensed software KDDES $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
002A21 P25 Trunking - Licensed software KDTRK $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
002A22 Diagnostic Monitoring - Licensed software KDZDM $208.33 $210.41 $212.50 $214.58 $216.66 
002A23 OTAR - Licensed software KDOTAR $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
002A24 Link Radio (per radio) - Licensed software KDLINK $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
002A25 Data/IP interface software - Licensed software KDDATA $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 

TRAINING 

002AA01

Training (per course), User Training, 2 Day, 20 
students maximum + travel & per diem charge. KDTRAIN $2,000.00 $2,020.00 $2,040.00 $2,060.00 $2,080.00 

TECHNICAL SERVICE MANUALS 
002AB01 Owners/Installation Manual KDMANUAL $50.00 $50.50 $51.00 $51.50 $52.00 

SERVICES 

002AC01

Consultation Service for base station or repeater 

installation (2 days): plus travel & per diem charges KDSITE $500.00 $505.00 $510.00 $515.00 $520.00 
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

X03 VHF BASE STATIONS WITHOUT CONTROL 
OPTIONS 

003A 100 Watts VHF 

003B 2-Radio Version 

003C 50 Watts VHF 

003D 2-Radio Version 

DMR-AAB4X1-

VH-XX-XXXX $13,600.00 $13,736.00 $13,872.00 $14,008.00 $14,144.00

DMR-AXB4X1-

VH-VH-XXXX $20,433.60 $20,637.94 $20,842.27 $21,046.61 $21,250.94

DMR-AAB4X1-

VL-XX-XXXX $12,470.40 $12,595.10 $12,719.81 $12,844.51 $12,969.22

DMR-AXB4X1-

VL-VL-XXXX $19,235.20 $19,427.55 $19,619.90 $19,812.26 $20,004.61


OPTIONS/UPGRADES/ACCESSORIES 
003A01 19" Rack Mounting KDFRMT $109.00 $110.09 $111.18 $112.27 $113.36 
003A02 Desk Mic KDMIC $108.00 $109.08 $110.16 $111.24 $112.32 
003A03 Palm DTMF Mic - Standard KDTMFMICS $145.00 $146.45 $147.90 $149.35 $150.80 
003A04 Palm DTMF Mic - Ruggedized KDTMFMICR $165.00 $166.65 $168.30 $169.95 $171.60 

Floor Mount Housing (60h x 25w x 26d) 2 door 
003A05 indoor locking cabinet) KDCAB60 $1,682.00 $1,698.82 $1,715.64 $1,732.46 $1,749.28 
003A06 Coaxial Relay and cables KDRELAY $545.00 $550.45 $555.90 $561.35 $566.80 
003A07 50 Watt PA Module KDPA50V $991.53 $1,001.45 $1,011.36 $1,021.28 $1,031.19 
003A08 100 Watt PA Module KDPA100V $1,491.67 $1,506.59 $1,521.50 $1,536.42 $1,551.34 
003A09 Interface Module (4 wire) KD4WIRE $560.70 $566.31 $571.91 $577.52 $583.13 
003A10 Interface Module (2/4 wire) KD24WIRE $2,500.00 $2,525.00 $2,550.00 $2,575.00 $2,600.00 
003A11 Base Controller Module KDCONTB $2,875.28 $2,904.03 $2,932.79 $2,961.54 $2,990.29 
003A12 Speaker Panel Assembly KDSPKR $183.33 $185.16 $187.00 $188.83 $190.66 
003A13 VHF Tranceiver module KDTCVR $4,943.88 $4,993.32 $5,042.76 $5,092.20 $5,141.64 
003A14 AC Power Supply (for 50 Watt PA) KDPS50V $1,402.50 $1,416.53 $1,430.55 $1,444.58 $1,458.60 
003A15 AC Power Supply (for 100 Watt PA) KDPS100V $1,700.00 $1,717.00 $1,734.00 $1,751.00 $1,768.00 
003A16 Dual station Case Assembly (with backplane) KDBCKPLN $2,916.67 $2,945.84 $2,975.00 $3,004.17 $3,033.34 

50 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver, 
003A17 Power Supply, 50W PA) KDTCVRPS50V $7,337.91 $7,411.29 $7,484.67 $7,558.05 $7,631.43 

100 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver, 
003A18 Power Supply, 100W PA) KDTCVRPS100V $8,155.55 $8,237.11 $8,318.66 $8,400.22 $8,481.77 
003A19 Transceiver Programming Software and Hardware KDPROG $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
003A20 P25 DES Encryption - Licensed software KDDES $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
003A21 P25 Trunking - Licensed software KDTRK $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
003A22 Diagnostic Monitoring - Licensed software KDZDM $208.33 $210.41 $212.50 $214.58 $216.66 
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

003A23 OTAR - Licensed software KDOTAR $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
003A24 Link Radio (per radio) - Licensed software KDLINK $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
003A25 Data/IP interface software - Licensed software KDDATA $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 

TRAINING 

003AA01

Training (per course), User Training, 2 Day, 20 
students maximum + travel & per diem charge. KDTRAIN $2,000.00 $2,020.00 $2,040.00 $2,060.00 $2,080.00 

TECHNICAL SERVICE MANUALS 
003AB01 Owners/Installation Manual KDMANUAL $50.00 $50.50 $51.00 $51.50 $52.00 

SERVICES 

003AC01

Consultation Service for base station or repeater 

installation (2 days): plus travel & per diem charges KDSITE $500.00 $505.00 $510.00 $515.00 $520.00 


X04 UHF BASE STATIONS WITHOUT CONTROL 
OPTIONS 

004A 100 Watts UHF 

004B 2-Radio Version 

004C 50 Watts UHF 

004D 2-Radio Version 

DMR-AAB4X2-

UH-XX-XXXX $13,900.00 $14,039.00 $14,178.00 $14,317.00 $14,456.00

DMR-AXB4X2-

UH-UH-XXXX $20,733.60 $20,940.94 $21,148.27 $21,355.61 $21,562.94

DMR-AAB4X2-

UL-XX-XXXX $12,770.40 $12,898.10 $13,025.81 $13,153.51 $13,281.22

DMR-AXB4X2-

UL-UL-XXXX $19,735.20 $19,932.55 $20,129.90 $20,327.26 $20,524.61


OPTIONS/UPGRADES/ACCESSORIES 
004A01 19" Rack Mounting KDFRMT $109.00 $110.09 $111.18 $112.27 $113.36 
004A02 Desk Mic KDMIC $108.00 $109.08 $110.16 $111.24 $112.32 
004A03 Palm DTMF Mic - Standard KDTMFMICS $145.00 $146.45 $147.90 $149.35 $150.80 
004A04 Palm DTMF Mic - Ruggedized KDTMFMICR $165.00 $166.65 $168.30 $169.95 $171.60 

Floor Mount Housing (60h x 25w x 26d) 2 door 
004A05 indoor locking cabinet) KDCAB60 $1,682.00 $1,698.82 $1,715.64 $1,732.46 $1,749.28 
004A06 Coaxial Relay and cables KDRELAY $545.00 $550.45 $555.90 $561.35 $566.80 
004A07 50 Watt PA Module KDPA50U $1,246.67 $1,259.14 $1,271.60 $1,284.07 $1,296.54 
004A08 100 Watt PA Module KDPA100U $1,716.67 $1,733.84 $1,751.00 $1,768.17 $1,785.34 
004A09 Interface Module (4 wire) KD4WIRE $560.70 $566.31 $571.91 $577.52 $583.13 
004A10 Interface Module (2/4 wire) KD24WIRE $2,500.00 $2,525.00 $2,550.00 $2,575.00 $2,600.00 
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

004A11 Base Controller Module KDCONTB $2,875.28 $2,904.03 $2,932.79 $2,961.54 $2,990.29 
004A12 Speaker Panel Assembly KDSPKR $183.33 $185.16 $187.00 $188.83 $190.66 
004A13 UHF Tranceiver module KDTCUR $5,218.88 $5,271.07 $5,323.26 $5,375.45 $5,427.64 
004A14 AC Power Supply (for 50 Watt PA) KDPS50U $1,402.50 $1,416.53 $1,430.55 $1,444.58 $1,458.60 
004A15 AC Power Supply (for 100 Watt PA) KDPS100U $1,700.00 $1,717.00 $1,734.00 $1,751.00 $1,768.00 
004A16 Dual station Case Assembly (with backplane) KDBCKPLN $2,916.67 $2,945.84 $2,975.00 $3,004.17 $3,033.34 

50 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver, 
Power Supply, 50W PA) KDTCVRPS50U $7,868.05 $7,946.73 $8,025.41 $8,104.09 $8,182.77004A17

100 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver,

Power Supply, 100W PA) KDTCVRPS100U $8,635.55 $8,721.91 $8,808.26 $8,894.62 $8,980.97
004A18


004A19 Transceiver Programming Software and Hardware KDPROG $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
004A20 P25 DES Encryption - Licensed software KDDES $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
004A21 P25 Trunking - Licensed software KDTRK $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
004A22 Diagnostic Monitoring - Licensed software KDZDM $208.33 $210.41 $212.50 $214.58 $216.66 
004A23 OTAR - Licensed software KDOTAR $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
004A24 Link Radio (per radio) - Licensed software KDLINK $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
004A25 Data/IP interface software - Licensed software KDDATA $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 

TRAINING 

004AA01

Training (per course), User Training, 2 Day, 20 
students maximum + travel & per diem charge. KDTRAIN $2,000.00 $2,020.00 $2,040.00 $2,060.00 $2,080.00 

TECHNICAL SERVICE MANUALS 
004AB01 Owners/Installation Manual KDMANUAL $50.00 $50.50 $51.00 $51.50 $52.00 

SERVICES 

004AC01

Consultation Service for base station or repeater 

installation (2 days): plus travel & per diem charges KDSITE $500.00 $505.00 $510.00 $515.00 $520.00 


ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

X05 VHF MOBILE RADIOS 

X05A NO BID 
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

OPTIONS/UPGRADES/ACCESSORIES 

005A1	
Mobile Data - KDT Mobile Data Terminal (with KDTKIT $1,240.00 $1,252.40 $1,264.92 $1,277.57 $1,290.35 mounting bracket & radio interface cable) 

005A2	
Mobile Data - ADM Mobile Data Terminal (with AMDKIT $1,340.00 $1,353.40 $1,366.93 $1,380.60 $1,394.41 mounting bracket & radio interface cable) 

005A3


Mobile Data - KDTBSM Base Supervisory Module, 
base modem, WinHOST/Remote Software, KRIC 
radio interface cable, KBCIC Base Modem/ Computer 
interface cable, KMDTRAIN training, and site visit 

KDTBASE $11,500.00 $11,615.00 $11,731.15 $11,848.46 $11,966.95 

005A4 Mobile Data - KDT-B Base Modem (includes KRIC 
radio interface cable and computer interconnect cable) KDTBM $1,595.00 $1,610.95 $1,626.90 $1,642.85 $1,658.80 

005A5 Mobile Data - ADM-B Base Modem (includes KRIC 
radio interface cable and computer interconnect cable) ADMBM $1,695.00 $1,711.95 $1,728.90 $1,745.85 $1,762.80 

005A6 Mobile Data - CAD Software - Windows based KDTCAD $2,295.00 $2,317.95 $2,340.90 $2,363.85 $2,386.80 

005A7 Cable - KRIC standard radio interface cable 
(terminated at MDT end, unterminated at radio end) KRIC $45.00 $45.45 $45.90 $46.35 $46.80 

005A8 AVL - KVL Mobile Vehicle Smart Modem (with 
GPS receiver/antenna and radio interface cable) KAVLSM $895.00 $903.95 $912.99 $922.12 $931.34 

005A9


AVL - KVLBSM Base Supervisory Module - includes 
TracKING mapping software, AVL-BM base modem, 
KRIC radio interface cable, KBCIC Base Modem/ 
Computer interface cable, and standard Map Data. 

KAVLBASE $4,995.00 $5,044.95 $5,095.40 $5,146.35 $5,197.82 


005A10 AVL - KGPS 12 Channel GPS Receiver/antenna only KAVLRX $395.00 $398.95 $402.94 $406.97 $411.04 - roof mount 

TRAINING 

005AA01

Training (per course), User Training, 2 Day, 20 
students maximum + travel & per diem charge. KMDTRAIN $2,000.00 $2,120.00 $2,247.20 $2,382.03 $2,524.95 

TECHNICAL SERVICE MANUALS 
005AB01 Owners/Installation Manual KMDMANUAL $50.00 $53.00 $56.18 $59.55 $63.12 

SERVICES 
Mobile Data/AVL on-line system/computer support 
(per session) KMDCNSLT $65.00 $68.90 $73.03 $77.42 $82.06005AC01


005AC02	
Mobile Data/AVL Installation consultation - customer KMDSITE $750.00 $795.00 $842.70 $893.26 $946.86site - 3 day + travel & per diem charges. 

005AC03

System Support - Extended Warranty Coverage - 40/5 
(Rate is for 12 months and based on $4.00 per Mobile 
Data Terminal per month) 

KMDSYS $48.00 $48.48 $48.96 $49.44 $49.92
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

X06 UHF MOBILE RADIOS 

X06A NO BID 

OPTIONS/UPGRADES/ACCESSORIES 

006A1 Mobile Data - KDT Mobile Data Terminal (with KDTKIT $1,240.00 $1,252.40 $1,264.92 $1,277.57 $1,290.35 mounting bracket & radio interface cable) 
Mobile Data - ADM Mobile Data Terminal (with AMDKIT $1,340.00 $1,353.40 $1,366.93 $1,380.60 $1,394.41006A2 mounting bracket & radio interface cable) 

006A3


Mobile Data - KDTBSM Base Supervisory Module, 
base modem, WinHOST/Remote Software, KRIC 
radio interface cable, KBCIC Base Modem/ Computer 
interface cable, KMDTRAIN training, and site visit 

KDTBASE $11,500.00 $11,615.00 $11,731.15 $11,848.46 $11,966.95 

006A4 Mobile Data - KDT-B Base Modem (includes KRIC 
radio interface cable and computer interconnect cable) KDTBM $1,595.00 $1,610.95 $1,626.90 $1,642.85 $1,658.80 

006A5 Mobile Data - ADM-B Base Modem (includes KRIC 
radio interface cable and computer interconnect cable) ADMBM $1,695.00 $1,711.95 $1,728.90 $1,745.85 $1,762.80 

006A6 Mobile Data - CAD Software - Windows based KDTCAD $2,295.00 $2,317.95 $2,340.90 $2,363.85 $2,386.80 

006A7 Cable - KRIC standard radio interface cable 
(terminated at MDT end, unterminated at radio end) KRIC $45.00 $45.45 $45.90 $46.35 $46.80 

006A8 AVL - KVL Mobile Vehicle Smart Modem (with 
GPS receiver/antenna and radio interface cable) KAVLSM $895.00 $903.95 $912.99 $922.12 $931.34 

006A9


AVL - KVLBSM Base Supervisory Module - includes 
TracKING mapping software, AVL-BM base modem, 
KRIC radio interface cable, KBCIC Base Modem/ 
Computer interface cable, and standard Map Data. 

KAVLBASE $4,995.00 $5,044.95 $5,095.40 $5,146.35 $5,197.82 


006A10 AVL - KGPS 12 Channel GPS Receiver/antenna only KAVLRX $395.00 $398.95 $402.94 $406.97 $411.04 - roof mount 

TRAINING 

006AA01

Training (per course), User Training, 2 Day, 20 
students maximum + travel & per diem charge. KMDTRAIN $2,000.00 $2,120.00 $2,247.20 $2,382.03 $2,524.95 

TECHNICAL SERVICE MANUALS 
006AB01 Owners/Installation Manual KMDMANUAL $50.00 $50.50 $51.00 $51.50 $52.00 
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

SERVICES


006AC01

Mobile Data/AVL on-line system/computer support 

(per session) KMDCNSLT $65.00 $68.90 $73.03 $77.42 $82.06


006AC02	
Mobile Data/AVL Installation consultation - customer KMDSITE $750.00 $795.00 $842.70 $893.26 $946.86site - 3 day + travel & per diem charges. 

006AC03

System Support - Extended Warranty Coverage - 40/5 
(Rate is for 12 months and based on $4.00 per Mobile 
Data Terminal per month) 

KMDSYS $48.00 $48.48 $48.96 $49.44 $49.92


X07 VHF PERSONAL PORTABLE RADIOS 

X07A NO BID 


X08 UHF PERSONAL PORTABLE RADIOS 

X08A NO BID 


X09 VHF “FIRE” PORTABLE RADIOS 

X09A NO BID 


X010 UHF “FIRE” PORTABLE RADIOS 

X10A NO BID 


X11 VHF REPEATER STATIONS – COMMERCIALLY 
POWERED 

DMR-AATXX1-

VH-XX-XXXX $11,466.67 $11,581.34 $11,696.00 $11,810.67 $11,925.34
011A 100 Watts VHF 
DMR-AXTXX1-

VH-VH-XXXX $19,541.07 $19,736.48 $19,931.89 $20,127.30 $20,322.71
011B 2-Radio Version 
DMR-AATXX1-

VL-XX-XXXX $11,000.00 $11,110.00 $11,220.00 $11,330.00 $11,440.00
011C 50 Watts VHF 
DMR-AXTXX1-

VL-VL-XXXX $18,032.62 $18,212.95 $18,393.27 $18,573.60 $18,753.92
011D 2-Radio Version 
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ITEM 
NO. 

SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/SERVICES PART 
NUMBER 

BASE 
YEAR 

CLINS 0XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 1 

CLINS 1XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 2 

CLINS 2XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 3 

CLINS 3XX 

OPTION 
YEAR 4 

CLINS 4XX 

OPTIONS/UPGRADES/ACCESSORIES 
011A01 19" Rack Mounting KDFRMT $109.00 $110.09 $111.18 $112.27 $113.36 
011A02 Desk Mic KDMIC $108.00 $109.08 $110.16 $111.24 $112.32 
011A03 Palm DTMF Mic - Standard KDTMFMICS $145.00 $146.45 $147.90 $149.35 $150.80 
011A04 Palm DTMF Mic - Ruggedized KDTMFMICR $165.00 $166.65 $168.30 $169.95 $171.60 

011A05

Floor Mount Housing (60h x 25w x 26d) 2 door 
indoor locking cabinet) KDCAB60 $1,682.00 $1,698.82 $1,715.64 $1,732.46 $1,749.28 

011A06 VHF Duplexer (for Rx/Tx separation > 600 kHz ) KDVDUP600 $1,887.00 $1,905.87 $1,924.74 $1,943.61 $1,962.48 
011A07 50 Watt PA Module KDPA50V $991.53 $1,001.45 $1,011.36 $1,021.28 $1,031.19 
011A08 100 Watt PA Module KDPA100V $1,491.67 $1,506.59 $1,521.50 $1,536.42 $1,551.34 
011A09 Interface Module (4 wire) KD4WIRE $560.70 $566.31 $571.91 $577.52 $583.13 
011A10 Interface Module (2/4 wire) KD24WIRE $2,500.00 $2,525.00 $2,550.00 $2,575.00 $2,600.00 
011A11 Repeater Controller Module KDCONTR $2,250.00 $2,272.50 $2,295.00 $2,317.50 $2,340.00 
011A12 Speaker Panel Assembly KDSPKR $183.33 $185.16 $187.00 $188.83 $190.66 
011A13 VHF Tranceiver module KDTCVR $4,943.88 $4,993.32 $5,042.76 $5,092.20 $5,141.64 
011A14 AC Power Supply (for 50 Watt PA) KDPS50V $1,402.50 $1,416.53 $1,430.55 $1,444.58 $1,458.60 
011A15 AC Power Supply (for 100 Watt PA) KDPS100V $1,700.00 $1,717.00 $1,734.00 $1,751.00 $1,768.00 
011A16 Dual station Case Assembly (with backplane) KDBCKPLN $2,916.67 $2,945.84 $2,975.00 $3,004.17 $3,033.34 

50 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver, 
Power Supply, 50W PA) KDTCVRPS50V $7,337.91 $7,411.29 $7,484.67 $7,558.05 $7,631.43011A17

100 Watt add-on kit for 2nd station (Transceiver,

Power Supply, 100W PA) KDTCVRPS100V $8,155.55 $8,237.11 $8,318.66 $8,400.22 $8,481.77
011A18


011A19 Transceiver Programming Software and Hardware KDPROG $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
011A20 P25 DES Encryption - Licensed software KDDES $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
011A21 P25 Trunking - Licensed software KDTRK $725.00 $732.25 $739.50 $746.75 $754.00 
011A22 Diagnostic Monitoring - Licensed software KDZDM $208.33 $210.41 $212.50 $214.58 $216.66 
011A23 OTAR - Licensed software KDOTAR $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
011A24 Link Radio (per radio) - Licensed software KDLINK $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 
011A25 Data/IP interface software - Licensed software KDDATA $475.00 $479.75 $484.50 $489.25 $494.00 

011A26

Networking Option #1 - 1 site 5 Chls 800 MHz 
Trunked KDSL-1 $74,734.95 $75,482.30 $76,229.65 $76,977.00 $77,724.35 

011A27 Networking Option #2 - 1 site 5 Chls Conv & P25 KDSL-2 $82,562.45 $83,388.07 $84,213.70 $85,039.32 $85,864.95 
Networking Option #3 - 2 sites 5 Chls 800 MHz 
Trunked KDSL-3 $93,844.15 $94,782.59 $95,721.03 $96,659.47 $97,597.92011A28


011A29 Networking Option #4 - 2 sites 5 Chls Conv & P25 KDSL-4 $109,499.15 $110,594.14 $111,689.13 $112,784.12 $113,879.12 
011A30 Networking Option #5 - 3 sites 10 Chls max 800 MHz KDSL-5 $100,732.35 $101,739.67 $102,747.00 $103,754.32 $104,761.64 

011A31

Networking Option #6 - 3 sites 10 Chls max Conv & 

P25 KDSL-6 $116,387.35 $117,551.22 $118,715.10 $119,878.97 $121,042.84
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10.5.5 External RF Jack - Each portable radio will provide an external RF connection (RF Jack) of 50 
ohms impedance, unbalanced. 

 
10.5.6 Accessories Jack - Each portable radio will contain an accessories jack to support a 

speaker/microphone and provisions for external data transfer capability. 
 
10.5.7 Channel Capability - Each radio shall provide a minimum channel capability of two hundred fifty 

six (256) channels. 
 
10.5.8 Transmitter Power Output - Each radio shall provide a programmable high/low power output with 

minimum adjustable range between 1 and 5 watts. 
 
10.5.9 Channel Selection – “Fire” personal portable radio equipment channel selection shall be by rotary 

detent channel selector switch with mechanical end stops.  “Fire” personal portable radio 
equipment shall not use "ramp" up/down channel selection switching. 

 
10.5.10 Carrying Case – “Fire” personal portable radios shall be supplied with a carrying case made of 

leather designed to protect the radio and permit operation without removal from the case.  The 
case shall have a loop for fastening to a belt.  A swivel type belt loop is unacceptable for “fire” 
portable radio use. 

 
10.5.11 Antenna - The portable station shall be supplied with a flexible helical whip antenna of the user’s 

selection from the vendor’s available offerings. 
 
10.5.12 Multi-mode Operation - The receiver and transmitter shall be capable of operating in analog wide-

band (25 kHz channel spacing/16 kHz bandwith/5 kHz modulation), analog narrow-band (12.5 
kHz channel spacing/11 kHz bandwith/2.5 kHz modulation), and narrow-band TIA-102 digital 
mode.  The receiver shall be capable of being programmed to automatically receive any of the 
three modes of operation without operator intervention. 

 
It is desired that the radio be capable of being programmed to automatically change modes of 
transmission to operate in the last received mode (analog wide-band, analog narrow-band, or 
narrow-band TIA-102 digital).  A programmable “revert” timer must also be included to define the 
time the transmitter will stay in the alternate received mode of operation. 
 

10.6 Non-Commercially Powered Transportable Repeater 
 
 All features listed below are subject to the standards and specifications listed in Sections 3, 4 and 5. 
 
10.6.1 Frequency Tolerance - Frequency tolerance (stability) shall be in accordance with the NTIA 

manual. 
 
10.6.2 Operating Voltage - Each Non-Commercially Powered Transportable station will have an 

operating voltage range of 10 - 18 VDC. 
 
10.6.3 Current drain - Maximum allowable current drain is 150 mA while in standby operation. 
 
10.6.4 Transmitter Power Output - The transmitter shall be capable of producing a minimum adjustable 

power output range of 2 to 8 watts rated at continuous duty. 
 
10.6.5 Multi-mode Operation - The receiver and transmitter shall be capable of operating in analog wide-

band (25 kHz channel spacing/16 kHz bandwith/5 kHz modulation), analog narrow-band (12.5 
kHz channel spacing/11 kHz bandwith/2.5 kHz modulation), and narrow-band TIA-102 digital 
mode.  The receiver shall be capable of being programmed to automatically receive any of the 
three modes of operation without operator intervention. 
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 Multimode radios must have the capability to automatically re-transmit in the mode that they 
receive in. 

 
10.7 Commercially Powered Transportable Repeater 
 
 All features listed below are subject to the standards and specifications listed in Sections 3, 4 and 5. 
 
10.7.1 Frequency Tolerance - Frequency tolerance (stability) shall be in accordance with the NTIA 

manual. 
 
10.7.2 Operating Voltage - Each Commercially Powered Transportable station will have an operating 

voltage range of 120 VAC, 60 Hz, and /or 10 - 18 VDC. 
 
10.7.3 Transmitter Power Output - The transmitter shall be capable of producing a continuous minimum 

adjustable power output range of: 
 

A.  High power stations at 60 to 100 watts 
B.  Mid power stations at 30 to 50 watts 
C.  Low power stations at 2 to 5 watts 

 
10.7.4 Multi-mode Operation - The receiver and transmitter shall be capable of operating in analog wide-

band (25 kHz channel spacing/16 kHz bandwith/5 kHz modulation), analog narrow-band (12.5 
kHz channel spacing/11 kHz bandwith/2.5 kHz modulation), and narrow-band TIA-102 digital 
mode.  The receiver shall be capable of being programmed to automatically receive any of the 
three modes of operation without operator intervention. 

 
 Multimode radios must have the capability to automatically re-transmit in the mode that they 

receive in. 
 
10.8 Aeronautical VHF-FM Transceiver 
 
 All features listed below are subject to the standards and specifications listed in Sections 3, 4 and 5.   The 

transceiver must also meet all applicable Radio Technical Committee for Avionics (RTCA) and Federal 
Aviation Administration (FAA) requirements for transceivers operated in an aircraft.  The main receiver 
and transmitter shall operate over a minimum frequency range of 136 MHz to 174 MHz in 2.5 kHz channel 
steps.  Maritime Mobile Station requirements are not required.  

 
 Operating Standards - The radio shall conform to applicable sections of 14 CFR Part 23.1309.  

Radio systems shall meet or exceed the following RTCA DO-160D specifications. 
 
 Control Heads and Panel Mounted Transceivers: 
 DO-160D Env. Cat. [A1Z]BAA[SU]XXXXXXABBBAUMXXXA 
 Remote Mounted Transceivers: 
 DO-160D Env. Cat. [B2Z]BAA[SU]XXXXXXBBBBAUMXXXA 
 
10.8.1 Main Receiver and Transmitter  
 
10.8.1.1 Channel/Frequency Selection:  Channel and frequency selection shall be provided to 

permit the operator (pilot) to select any preset channel, frequency, frequency pair, 
CTCSS tones, CDCSS digital code word, NAC, and Talk Group ID while in flight.  The 
sole exception is the guard receiver and transmitter whose frequency shall be preset. 

 
10.8.1.2 Channel Presets – The main radio shall be a minimum of one hundred (100) operator 

selectable preset channels.  The guard radio shall have a maximum of  two (2) selectable 
preset channels.  Preset channels shall contain receive and transmit frequencies, CTCSS 
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tones, CDCSS digital code words, NAC codes, Talk Group ID’s, Scan settings, and 
alphanumeric channel information. 

 
10.8.1.3 Transmitter - The transmitter shall have an operator selectable ten (10) watt nominal 

(high) and one (1) watt nominal (low) output power selection.  The transmitter shall not 
be designed for operation of more than 10 watts nominal.  The transmitter shall operate at 
the rated power and meet specifications after operation for a 30 second interval of 
transmitting into both a short circuit and an open circuit load connected to the antenna 
port via a proper coaxial cable varied uniformly over a half-wave length. 

 
10.8.2 Guard Receiver 
 
10.8.2.1 Frequency Generation - The guard receiver shall be either synthesized or crystal 

controlled. The guard receiver shall meet the same requirements as the main receiver but 
channel one (1) must operate on 168.6250 MHz in either analog or digital modes. 

 
10.8.2.2 Guard Receiver Frequency - The frequency of 168.6250 MHz shall be simultaneously 

monitored with the main frequency for guard reception. 
 
10.8.2.3 Guard Transmit - A means of quickly selecting the guard transmitter frequency shall be 

provided (i.e. a main/guard toggle switch).  A second transmitter selector shall be 
available if two guard presets are provided (i.e., guard 1/guard 2). 

 
10.8.3 Multi-mode Operation - The receiver and transmitter shall be capable of operating in analog wide-

band (25 kHz channel spacing/16 kHz bandwith/5 kHz modulation), analog narrow-band (12.5 
kHz channel spacing/11 kHz bandwith/2.5 kHz modulation), and narrow-band TIA-102 digital 
mode.  The receiver  shall be capable of being programmed to automatically receive any of the 
three modes of operation without operator intervention. 

 
 It is desired that the radio be capable of being programmed to automatically change modes of 

transmission to operate in the last received mode (analog wide-band, analog narrow-band, or 
narrow-band TIA-102 digital).  A programmable “revert” timer must also be included to define the 
time the transmitter will stay in the alternate received mode of operation. 

 
10.8.4 Encryption/OTAR - The radio shall be capable of encryption and Over the Air Re-keying 

(OTAR).  When optioned, voice and data encryption shall be TIA-102 compliant. 
 
10.8.5 Audio Input Sensitivity 
 
10.8.5.1. The audio required to fully modulate the transmitter shall not exceed that normally 

produced by the aircraft's audio system and/or microphone (reference 14 CFR Part 21, 
FAA AC 21-110(*), RTCA DO-214, and RTCA DO-160D). 

 
10.8.5.2. The radio shall have microphone audio, push-to-talk (PTT), and receive audio available 

for interface with the aircraft audio system.  Audio shall be 600-ohm impedance.  The 
microphone will normally be a noise canceling, single button carbon or amplified 
dynamic microphone, commonly used in aircraft communications (typically 100 ohm 
impedance, 250 millivolts).  PTT operation shall be provided by contact closure to 
airframe ground. 

 
10.8.6 Transmit Sidetone Audio 
 
10.8.6.1 Sidetone audio shall be provided to permit the operator to monitor audio input to the 

transmitter and to assist the operator with word annunciation during high ambient noise 
conditions. 
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10.8.6.2 Sidetone output shall be 3 to 10 dB below the adjusted receiver output level.  Sidetone 
distortion shall not exceed 5%.  Sidetone level shall be adjustable (up to 5 VRMS 
minimum) while the radio is connected to the aircraft's audio system without 
disassembling the radio. 

 
10.8.7 Display - The radio shall simultaneously display the channel number in use, and either the 

frequency in use or an operator programmable eight character (minimum) alpha numeric channel 
designator.  The display of the frequency and alpha numeric channel designator must be operator 
selectable if it is not simultaneously displayed. A means of identifying wide-band, narrow-band, 
and digital operation shall be displayed.  Controls and the display shall meet human factors and 
have a minimum acceptable viewing angle of +/- 80 degrees.  Display information shall be easily 
visible in direct sunlight.  

 
10.8.8 Volume Controls - Separate volume controls shall be provided for the main and guard receive 

audio outputs.  The audio outputs shall be combined as a single output. 
 
10.8.9 Primary Power - A primary power on/off switch shall be provided.  The radio shall operate on a 

nominal +27.5 VDC and draw no more than 10 amperes in transmit operation. 
 
10.8.10 Indicators - Indicators shall be provided to indicate transmitter activation and signal reception for 

the main and guard radios. 
 
10.8.11 Squelch Override - A squelch override switch shall be provided to the operator for audio testing 

and volume adjustment.. 
 
10.8.12 Scanning/Priority - All main preset channels shall be capable of being scanned.  Scanning shall be 

enabled/disabled by the operator on a per channel basis.   A priority channel shall be operator 
selectable.  A means of identifying that the radio is scanning shall be displayed.   

 
10.8.13 DTMF - A standard 12-digit Dual-Tone Multi-Frequency (DTMF) encoder pad shall be included. 
 
10.8.14 Time-Out-Timer - A time-out-timer shall be operator enabled/disabled.  The time-out-timer shall 

turn off the transmitter after 90 seconds of continuous operation.  It shall reset when the 
transmitter PTT circuit is deactivated. 

 
10.8.15 Cooling - The radio shall be self cooled. 
 
10.8.16 Front Panel - The front panel shall be a backlit panel operable from the avionics dimming bus 

operating on a nominal 27.5 VDC. 
 
10.8.17 Identification Tag - An identification tag(s) containing all required markings will be permanently 

affixed to the exterior of each unit for quick identification.  Minimum information shall include:  
Manufacturer, model number, part number, serial number, revision/modification status, and all 
software versions currently loaded into major radio components. 

 
10.8.18 Labeling - All controls shall be clearly and permanently labeled and shall be easily discernible 

whenever the backlit panel is illuminated. 
 
10.8.19 Programming 
 
10.8.19.1 Presets - All preset channels shall be operator programmable utilizing front panel controls 

with the pilot wearing the required personal protective equipment (i.e. flight gloves) 
while in flight.  The main and guard receivers shall not be disabled during programming.  
Programming shall not require that the radio be turned off to enable new operator-
programmed settings. 
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10.8.19.2 Guard Frequency - Guard frequency programming and edit functions shall be disabled 
during normal programming operations to ensure that the guard preset frequency 
assignment remains undisturbed during main frequency programming operations.  A 
means of disabling operator guard programming shall be provided thus limiting guard 
programming functions to maintenance or computer-to-radio capability. 

 
11  SOFTWARE - OPERATING, PROGRAMMING AND DIAGNOSTIC  
 

All operating, programming and diagnostic software shall be available to program and test the radios in all 
three operating modes, TIA-102 digital narrowband, analog narrowband and analog wideband, and shall be 
available at the time of offer. 

 
11.1 Licenses - All applicable software licenses shall be furnished for each radio purchased under this contract.  

The license shall allow unlimited use of the software for each specific facility location.   This unlimited use 
of software shall also be applicable to keyloader operations (encryption), where required. 

 
11.2 Media - Software shall be provided on 3-1/2" IBM formatted diskette(s) or CD-ROM.  CD-ROM is 

preferred. 
 
11.2.1 Quantities - Quantities shall be established on a per order basis. 
 
11.3 Programming interface equipment - Quantities shall be established on a per order basis.   
 
11.4 Computer Operating System  - Diagnostic and programming software shall run under Windows 95, 

Windows 98, or Windows NT.  DOS based software is not acceptable. 
 
11.5 Software Updates - Updates of radio programming and radio operating software/firmware, and any 

associated hardware required, (e.g., ROM and/or EEPROM) shall be provided for the first three years after 
delivery at no additional cost to the Government.  Software updates shall be provided to all delivery 
locations in the same quantities as delivered for the initial software orders. 

 
11.6 Software Password Protection - Password protection of all programmable input data shall be available.  For 

multiple zone radios, password protection shall also be available on a zone by zone basis.  Each zone shall 
be able to have its own unique password. 

 
11.7 Cloning for “Fire” Personal Portable - Cloning capability in portables (portable-to-portable), including 

interface cabling as required, will be supplied as listed above. “Complete” radio-to-radio and “zone-by-
zone” cloning capability is required and will be consistent throughout a radio's life cycle.  Radio-to-radio 
and zone-by-zone cloning ability/capability will not be limited to a specific software revision or hardware 
version (e.g., software version or ROM and/or EEPROM revision) but will extend to all radios of the same 
type regardless of date of manufacture. 

 
In a “complete” radio-to-radio clone, the following items shall not be cloned: 
 

1.  Electronic serial number 
2.  Unit Identifier (ID) 
3.  Encryption Keys 
4.  IP Address, if applicable 

 
It is desired to have portable-to-mobile radio cloning capability if a manufacturer produces both a 
portable and a mobile radio. 
  

11.8 Keyboard Programmability for  “Fire” Portable Radios – “Fire” portable radios shall have the following 
capabilities programmable from the keyboard. 

 
11.8.1 Frequencies - Transmit and receive frequencies shall be individually programmable by channel. 
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11.8.2 Analog Mode Squelch Control - In analog mode, input of CTCSS tone frequencies or CDCSS 

codes (code words) shall be available on a frequency by frequency (receive or transmit channel) 
basis.  The ability to enable or disable this function shall also be available on a receive or transmit 
channel basis.  

 
11.8.3 Digital Mode Controls - In digital mode, the input of Network Access Codes (NAC) and Talk 

Group IDs shall be available on a frequency by frequency (receive or transmit channel) basis. 
 
11.8.4 Mode Selection List - A sixteen (16) item selection list or equivalent, from the keyboard, shall be 

available for the selection of the desired CTCSS, CDCSS, NAC and Talk Group on a channel by 
channel basis. 

 
11.8.5 Password Protection - The ability to input or change software passwords shall be available from 

the keyboard. 
 
12   MANUALS 
 
12.1 Technical Service Manuals (TSM) - TSMs shall be packaged with the associated equipment and shall 

furnish adequate information for installation and maintenance.  As a minimum, the following shall be 
included in each TSM as applicable: 

 
(a) Initial installation instructions, 
(b) Service adjustment instructions, 
(c) Complete schematic diagrams and parts list, photographs, diagrams or other aids 
showing the location of all components.  Printed circuit board diagrams showing all 
component locations and printed circuit traces, 
(d) Complete alignment instructions, 
(e) Description of circuit operation, 
(f) Intercabling diagrams, 
(g) Block diagrams, 
(h) Maintenance and troubleshooting procedures, 
(i) Technical specifications 
(j) Specific configurations, such as VHF/UHF crossband linking and RF or Microwave 
interface Links, remote control, etc. 

 
12.1.1 Quantities - Quantities shall be established on a per order basis. 
 
12.1.2 CD-ROM Option - If a CD-ROM version of the TSM is available, it may be ordered on a per 

order basis. 
 
12.2 User Manuals 
 

One hard copy of the Users Manual will be furnished per base, mobile, portable and aircraft unit.  The User 
Manual shall describe the features of the specific radio equipment furnished and how to use it.  This User 
Manual shall be the same manual provided to commercial customers. 

 
13  TRAINING 
 

Complete technical diagnostic and maintenance training courses shall be offered for each specific type of 
radio equipment furnished under this contract.  Courses covering more than one equipment type will be 
acceptable.  Each training course shall be offered at least semi-annually.  Each shall be available at fixed 
price throughout the base year and each option year of the contract. 
 
All student training materials required for the training shall be included in the cost of the training and shall 
become the property of the Government upon completion of the training. 
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14 COMMUNICATION TEST SET 
 

A communications service monitor/analyzer is a consolidated electronic test device that is capable of 
providing various performance tests on amplitude modulated, analog frequency modulated, and digitally 
modulated receivers and transmitters.  The digital mode must conform to the TIA-102 Common-Air-
Interface standard.  The service monitor must have the capability of performing all tests in the minimum 
frequency range of 1 MHz to 1000 MHz.  Time based aging must be better than 0.5 PPM per year.  Time 
base stability must be better than 0.05PPM 
 
The monitor shall operate with the functionality of the following discrete test instruments. 
 

• RF frequency meter 
• RF signal generator 
• Spectrum analyzer with tracking generator 
• Modulation meter 
• BER meter 
• Power meter 
• SINAD and distortion meter 
• Audio frequency counter 
• Audio tone signal generator 
• CTCSS, CDCSS, and DTMF encoder 
• CTCSS and CDCSS decoder 
• DTMF tone sequence decoder 
• TDMR Cable fault locator 
• Oscilloscope  
• Signal strength meter 

 
The monitor must be capable of performing the following digital diagnostic tests and measurements; 
     

• Free running BER capability.  Measurement range from 0 to 20% BER. 
• Encryption /decryption capable : DES, DES XL, DES OFB (optional feature) 
• P25 Trunking (Optional Feature) 
• Generation of digital 1011Hz test tone frame 
• Generation of digital 5%BER calibration tone 
• Generation of digital silence signal frame 
• P25 Link control field decoder 
• Decoding of P25 code words, including Link Control Format, high speed data, low speed data, and 

raw data stream 
• P25 digital keypad decoder 
• P25 digital voice frame encoder/decoder 

 
15  SCANNING MONITOR RECEIVER 
 

All features listed below are subject to the Receiver Standards and Specifications listed in Sections 3, 4 and 
5.   
 
The Scanning Monitor Receiver shall be capable of being dash mounted in a vehicle or used as a desk-top 
base station.  Primary power shall be from 12 VDC (nominal) with external 120 VAC, 60 Hz wall 
transformer/power pack available, or internal integrated 120 VAC power supply, for base station operation.  
The receiver shall be provided with a telescopic antenna, AC adapter (if applicable), cigarette lighter cord, 
DC power cord, and mobile mounting bracket and screws. 
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15.1 Frequency Coverage - Frequency coverage shall be continuous in the range of 25 MHz to1300 MHz, 
excluding the cellular bands (824 to 849 and 869 to 894 MHz) and the UHF television bands (512 to 745 
MHz).  The 700 MHz Public Safety band shall be included. 

 
15.2 Programmable Channel Scan - The Scanning Monitor Receiver shall have at least 500 individual memory 

channels that are capable of being scanned.  The channel configuration shall be arranged such that each 
zone or bank shall contain approximately 50 channels.  For example: 10 zones of 50 channels. 

 
15.3 Squelch/Selective Calling Systems - In analog mode of operation, the receiver shall support CTCSS and 

CDCSS as defined in TIA/EIA-603, on a per channel basis.  In the TIA-102 digital mode of operation, the 
receiver shall support the use of NACs (Network Access Codes) and TGIDs (Talk-Group IDs), on a per 
channel basis.       

 
15.4 Priority Channels - Any single channel shall be capable of being designated as a priority channel.  At least 

10 channels shall be capable of being designated as a priority channel.  
 
15.5 Antenna Connector - A "standard" 50 ohm BNC type connector shall be provided for connection to an 

external antenna.  An internal switchable in-line attenuator shall be provided for use in high RF 
environments. 

 
15.6 Alpha-Numeric Display - The receiver shall be provided with a backlit LCD display and have the 

capability to display all pertinent channel information, such as frequency, channel number, alpha channel 
tag, received signal strength indicator, selective calling code (CTCSS, CDCSS, NAC, TGID), and other 
scanning mode status indicators. 

 
15.7 Front Panel Controls - The front panel keypad and control knobs shall be backlit to enhance operation in 

low light conditions.  
 
15.8 Multi-mode Operation - The receiver shall be capable of operating in analog wide-band (25 kHz 

bandwidth/5 kHz modulation), analog narrow-band (12.5 kHz bandwidth/2.5 kHz modulation), narrow-
band TIA-102 digital mode, wide broadcast FM mode (75 kHz modulation), and AM.  Conventional, as 
well as trunked operation is required.  The scanning receiver shall support TIA-102 trunked operation.  
Support of other commonly used trunking formats is desirable. 

 
15.9 Speaker - An integral 2 watt, or greater, speaker matched to the audio amplifier shall be furnished.  A jack 

for connection to an external speaker shall be provided. 
 
15.10 Remote Control Operation - A standard RS-232C port shall be provided for PC control and remote 

operation of all aspects of the receiver. 
 
15.11 Cloning Feature - Cloning capability, on a zone-by-zone basis, of programmed channels, from one unit to 

another shall be provided.         
 
16  SERVICES 
 

Specific services may be offered as an option.  Such services shall be performed at the customer and/or 
vendor’s service locations during normal business hours.  Services shall be provided by qualified personnel 
and performed in accordance with any manufacturer’s instructions and good commercial practices. Special 
transportation needs (helicopter, boat, snowmobile, horses) may be provided by the government. 

 
16.1 Equipment Installation/Removal – This service category is self-explanatory in that it provides for the 

installation and removal of fixed equipment, including mobile radios with antennas.  Mobile installations 
should be quoted for both Front mount and trunk mount radios.  Installation shall include hookup to power 
supply, antenna leads, and telephone lines, and system grounding (TIA/EIA-607, Commercial Building 
Grounding and Bonding Requirements for Telecommunications (ANSI/TIA/EAI-607-94)), antenna 
systems, photo-voltaic systems, programming, and operational checks as applicable.  Radio programming 
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may be provided by the Government.  Removal shall only be required in conjunction with orders for 
installation of new equipment. When removing old radios, cables are not to be cut. Antenna holes when not 
being reused will have rubber plugs installed in them.  Repeater installation shall include installation of 
duplexers, RF isolators, combiners and shall include documented duplexer desensitization measurements, 
duplexer insertion loss measurements, adjacent channel rejection measurements, and site noise levels.  
Documented site measurements, as per TIA/EIA-603, will be provided to the customer. 

 
16.2 Maintenance Service – This service category is similar to extended warranty service, whereby the vendor 

agrees to keep the equipment up to manufacturer specifications and make all necessary repairs, if and when 
needed.  This service includes the labor and parts required to repair units that have become defective 
through normal wear and usage, as well as shipping cost to and from the repair facility. 

 
  


